












LOT I  - Road Salt

Bidder
Item 
Number County

 
Require
ment  Price per Ton  Stockpile Location(s) 

 Type of 
Salt 

American Rock Salt Co., LLC 1 Albany 73155 58.1168$            Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 2 Allegany 43900 47.4136$            Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 3 Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens, Richmond* 1218 N/A This item is being renewed under contract # 22730
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 4 Broome 77552 59.5560$            Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 5 Cattaraugus 68823 53.8764$            Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 6 Cayuga & Seneca 57200 53.3288$            Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 7 Chautauqua 86125 58.2568$            Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 8 Chemung & Tioga 57104 47.0576$            Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 9 Chenango 42768 64.1592$            Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 10 Clinton 30640 119.1136$          Norwood, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 11 Columbia 45916 63.0784$            Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 12 Cortland & Tompkins 74345 80.3504 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 13 Delaware 54310 60.0832 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 14 Dutchess 86270 103.3552 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 15 Erie 150844 48.9008 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 16 Essex 21290 78.0664 Ft. Ann,HC,Norwood Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 17 Franklin 28000 119.1084 Norwood, NY,Ogdensburg, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 18 Fulton & Montgomery 65477 91.7744 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 19 Genesee & Orleans 37275 47.1352 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 20 Greene 26097 92.8568 Hampton Corners,Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 21 Hamilton 19190 99.2448 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 22 Herkimer 49980 86.376 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 23 Jefferson 78085 56.7768 Watertown, NY,Weedsport, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 24 Lewis 23175 59.6536 Watertown, NY,Weedsport, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 25 Livingston & Wyoming 25589 44.9064 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 26 Madison 35028 59.7464 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 27 Monroe 160843 46.3064 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 28 Nassau* 60886 102.6384 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 29 Niagara 64887 49.9 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 30 Oneida 114431 62.0984 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 31 Onondaga 71584 54.684 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 32 Ontario 80660 47.1352 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 33 Orange 120498 100.0736 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 34 Oswego 22627 48.6144 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 35 Otsego 59120 89.4784 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 36 Putnam 40400 107.3088 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 37 Rensselaer 64132 57.68 Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 38 Rockland* 49521 106.144 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 39 St. Lawrence 47972 92.48 Ogdensburg, HC Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 40 Saratoga 32341 59.1508 Fort Ann, NY,Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 41 Schenectady 43490 57.4724 Hampton Corners,Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 42 Schoharie 31855 94.4848 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 43 Schuyler & Yates 21785 50.2152 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 44 Steuben 59015 48.468 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 45 Suffolk* 129971 107.0288 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 46 Sullivan 59916 93.9808 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 47 Ulster 47567 99.6816 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 48 Warren 31650 68.146 Fort Ann, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 49 Washington 34741 61.6876 Fort Ann, NY,Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 50 Wayne 48635 45.6888 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 51 Westchester* 156259 111.0944 Hampton Corners Rock

Atlantic Salt, Inc. 1 Albany 73155 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 2 Allegany 43900 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 3 Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens, Richmond* 1218 N/A This item is being renewed under contract # 22730
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 4 Broome 77552 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 5 Cattaraugus 68823 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 6 Cayuga & Seneca 57200 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 7 Chautauqua 86125 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 8 Chemung & Tioga 57104 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 9 Chenango 42768 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 10 Clinton 30640 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 11 Columbia 45916 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 12 Cortland & Tompkins 74345 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 13 Delaware 54310 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 14 Dutchess 86270 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 15 Erie 150844 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 16 Essex 21290 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 17 Franklin 28000 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 18 Fulton & Montgomery 65477 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 19 Genesee & Orleans 37275 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 20 Greene 26097 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 21 Hamilton 19190 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 22 Herkimer 49980 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 23 Jefferson 78085 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 24 Lewis 23175 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 25 Livingston & Wyoming 25589 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 26 Madison 35028 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 27 Monroe 160843 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 28 Nassau* 60886 64.3 1 Richmond Ter, S.I., NY 10301; 184 Marsh St, Newark, NJk and Solar
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 29 Niagara 64887 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 30 Oneida 114431 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 31 Onondaga 71584 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 32 Ontario 80660 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 33 Orange 120498 78.75 1 Richmond Ter, S.I., NY 10301; 184 Marsh St, Newark, NJ Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 34 Oswego 22627 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 35 Otsego 59120 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 36 Putnam 40400 76.65 1 Richmond Ter, S.I., NY 10301; 184 Marsh St, Newark, NJ Rock
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Atlantic Salt, Inc. 37 Rensselaer 64132 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 38 Rockland* 49521 62.6 1 Richmond Ter, S.I., NY 10301; 184 Marsh St, Newark, NJk and Solar
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 39 St. Lawrence 47972 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 40 Saratoga 32341 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 41 Schenectady 43490 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 42 Schoharie 31855 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 43 Schuyler & Yates 21785 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 44 Steuben 59015 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 45 Suffolk* 129971 68.75 1 Richmond Ter, S.I., NY 10301; 184 Marsh St, Newark, NJk and Solar
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 46 Sullivan 59916 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 47 Ulster 47567 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 48 Warren 31650 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 49 Washington 34741 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 50 Wayne 48635 No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 51 Westchester* 156259 61.4 1 Richmond Ter, S.I., NY 10301; 184 Marsh St, Newark, NJk and Solar

Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 1 Albany 73155 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 2 Allegany 43900 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 3 Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens, Richmond* 1218 N/A This item is being renewed under contract # 22730
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 4 Broome 77552 46.9700$            Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 5 Cattaraugus 68823 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 6 Cayuga & Seneca 57200 42.6800$            Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 7 Chautauqua 86125 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 8 Chemung & Tioga 57104 44.7800$            Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 9 Chenango 42768 49.4700$            Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 10 Clinton 30640 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 11 Columbia 45916 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 12 Cortland & Tompkins 74345 41.45 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 13 Delaware 54310 57.54 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 14 Dutchess 86270 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 15 Erie 150844 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 16 Essex 21290 77.26 Albany NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 17 Franklin 28000 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 18 Fulton & Montgomery 65477 58.29 Fort Plain, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 19 Genesee & Orleans 37275 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 20 Greene 26097 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 21 Hamilton 19190 69.43 Fort Plain, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 22 Herkimer 49980 52.27 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 23 Jefferson 78085 58.71 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 24 Lewis 23175 59.34 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 25 Livingston & Wyoming 25589 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 26 Madison 35028 49.4 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 27 Monroe 160843 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 28 Nassau* 60886 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 29 Niagara 64887 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 30 Oneida 114431 51.16 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 31 Onondaga 71584 46.99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 32 Ontario 80660 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 33 Orange 120498 68.17 Bloomingburg, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 34 Oswego 22627 50.36 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 35 Otsego 59120 51.08 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 36 Putnam 40400 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 37 Rensselaer 64132 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 38 Rockland* 49521 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 39 St. Lawrence 47972 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 40 Saratoga 32341 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 41 Schenectady 43490 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 42 Schoharie 31855 68.23 Albany NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 43 Schuyler & Yates 21785 42.93 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 44 Steuben 59015 46.79 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 45 Suffolk* 129971 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 46 Sullivan 59916 63.11 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 47 Ulster 47567 70.31 Mount Marion, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 48 Warren 31650 72.18 Albany NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 49 Washington 34741 NO BID Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 50 Wayne 48635 55.44 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 51 Westchester* 156259 NO BID

Morton Salt, Inc. 1 Albany 73,155 61.43$                Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 2 Allegany 43,900 No Bid Rock

Morton Salt, Inc. 3 Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens, Richmond* 1,218 N/A This item is being renewed under contract # 22730
Morton Salt, Inc. 4 Broome 77,552 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 5 Cattaraugus 68,823 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 6 Cayuga & Seneca 57,200 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 7 Chautauqua 86,125 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 8 Chemung & Tioga 57,104 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 9 Chenango 42,768 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 10 Clinton 30,640 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 11 Columbia 45,916 56.75$                Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 12 Cortland & Tompkins 74345 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 13 Delaware 54310 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 14 Dutchess 86270 63.77 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 15 Erie 150844 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 16 Essex 21290 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 17 Franklin 28000 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 18 Fulton & Montgomery 65477 65.27 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 19 Genesee & Orleans 37275 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 20 Greene 26097 62.58 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 21 Hamilton 19190 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 22 Herkimer 49980 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 23 Jefferson 78085 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 24 Lewis 23175 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 25 Livingston & Wyoming 25589 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 26 Madison 35028 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 27 Monroe 160843 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 28 Nassau* 60886 103.29 Port Newark, NJ



Morton Salt, Inc. 29 Niagara 64887 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 30 Oneida 114431 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 31 Onondaga 71584 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 32 Ontario 80660 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 33 Orange 120498 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 34 Oswego 22627 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 35 Otsego 59120 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 36 Putnam 40400 76.51 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 37 Rensselaer 64132 61.45 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 38 Rockland* 49521 85.09 Port Newark, NJ
Morton Salt, Inc. 39 St. Lawrence 47972 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 40 Saratoga 32341 58.57 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 41 Schenectady 43490 60.99 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 42 Schoharie 31855 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 43 Schuyler & Yates 21785 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 44 Steuben 59015 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 45 Suffolk* 129971 106.17 Port Newark, NJ
Morton Salt, Inc. 46 Sullivan 59916 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 47 Ulster 47567 68.73 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 48 Warren 31650 69.98 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 49 Washington 34741 67.25 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 50 Wayne 48635 No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 51 Westchester* 156259 89.13 Port Newark, NJ

North American Salt Co. 1 Albany 73,155 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 2 Allegany 43,900 NO BID Rock

North American Salt Co. 3 Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens, Richmond* 1,218 N/A This item is being renewed under contract # 22730
North American Salt Co. 4 Broome 77,552 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 5 Cattaraugus 68,823 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 6 Cayuga & Seneca 57,200 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 7 Chautauqua 86,125 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 8 Chemung & Tioga 57,104 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 9 Chenango 42,768 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 10 Clinton 30,640 93.52$                Ogdensburg, NY or Ste Catherine PQ Rock
North American Salt Co. 11 Columbia 45916 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 12 Cortland & Tompkins 74345 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 13 Delaware 54310 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 14 Dutchess 86270 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 15 Erie 150844 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 16 Essex 21290 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 17 Franklin 28000 95.68 Ogdensburg, NY or Ste Catherine PQ Rock
North American Salt Co. 18 Fulton & Montgomery 65477 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 19 Genesee & Orleans 37275 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 20 Greene 26097 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 21 Hamilton 19190 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 22 Herkimer 49980 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 23 Jefferson 78085 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 24 Lewis 23175 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 25 Livingston & Wyoming 25589 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 26 Madison 35028 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 27 Monroe 160843 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 28 Nassau* 60886 NO BID
North American Salt Co. 29 Niagara 64887 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 30 Oneida 114431 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 31 Onondaga 71584 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 32 Ontario 80660 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 33 Orange 120498 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 34 Oswego 22627 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 35 Otsego 59120 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 36 Putnam 40400 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 37 Rensselaer 64132 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 38 Rockland* 49521 NO BID
North American Salt Co. 39 St. Lawrence 47972 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 40 Saratoga 32341 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 41 Schenectady 43490 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 42 Schoharie 31855 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 43 Schuyler & Yates 21785 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 44 Steuben 59015 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 45 Suffolk* 129971 NO BID
North American Salt Co. 46 Sullivan 59916 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 47 Ulster 47567 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 48 Warren 31650 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 49 Washington 34741 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 50 Wayne 48635 NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 51 Westchester* 156259 NO BID



LOT II  - Treated Salt, Type I

Bidder
Item 

Number County
Filed Requirement 

(tons)
 Price per 

Ton  Stockpile Locations  Finished Product Name  Salt Color 
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 52 Albany 8000 75.7300$   Troy, NY Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 54 Broome 400 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 55 Cayuga 4706 65.5600$   Hampton Corners Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 56 Chautauqua 1035 67.1600$   Hampton Corners Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 57 Chenango 200 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 58 Columbia 600 79.8700$   Troy, NY Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 59 Cortland 1800 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 61 Essex 31600 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 62 Franklin 5500 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 64 Greene 6665 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 65 Herkimer 5267 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 66 Jefferson 6000 74.5600$   Hampton Corners Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 67 Lewis 700 77.03 Hampton Corners Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 69 Madison 1815 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 71 Montgomery 551 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 73 Oneida 10855 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 74 Onondaga 12963 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 75 Ontario 250 55.5568 Hampton Corners Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 76 Orange 2335 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 78 Rensselaer 910 80.97 Troy, NY Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 79 Rockland 2475 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 80 Schenectady 633 74.53 Hampton Corners,Troy, NY Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 82 Sullivan 250 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 83 Ulster 3178 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 84 Warren 12800 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 85 Washington 600 82.2 Troy, NY Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 87 Westchester 295 98.8 Hampton Corners Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 60 Erie 240 58.9840$   Hampton Corners Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 68 Livingston 700 52.1856 Hampton Corners Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 70 Monroe 2800 54.0672 Hampton Corners Blue Magic Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 86 Wayne 200 56.3408 Hampton Corners Blue Magic Blue

Atlantic Salt, Inc. 52 Albany 8000 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 54 Broome 400 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 55 Cayuga 4706 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 56 Chautauqua 1035 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 57 Chenango 200 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 58 Columbia 600 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 59 Cortland 1800 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 61 Essex 31600 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 62 Franklin 5500 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 64 Greene 6665 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 65 Herkimer 5267 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 66 Jefferson 6000 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 67 Lewis 700 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 69 Madison 1815 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 71 Montgomery 551 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 73 Oneida 10855 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 74 Onondaga 12963 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 75 Ontario 250 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 76 Orange 2335 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 78 Rensselaer 910 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 79 Rockland 2475 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 80 Schenectady 633 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 82 Sullivan 250 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 83 Ulster 3178 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 84 Warren 12800 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 85 Washington 600 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 87 Westchester 295 No Bid

Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 52 Albany 8000 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 54 Broome 400 57.4700$   Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 55 Cayuga 4706 53.1800$   Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 56 Chautauqua 1035 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 57 Chenango 200 59.9700$   Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 58 Columbia 600 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 59 Cortland 1800 51.9500$   Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 61 Essex 31600 87.7600$   Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 62 Franklin 5500 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 64 Greene 6665 85.6500$   Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 65 Herkimer 5267 62.7700$   Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 66 Jefferson 6000 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 67 Lewis 700 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 69 Madison 1815 64.9 Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 71 Montgomery 551 68.79 Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 73 Oneida 10855 61.66 Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 74 Onondaga 12963 57.49 Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 75 Ontario 250 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 76 Orange 2335 88.67 Bloomingburg, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 78 Rensselaer 910 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 79 Rockland 2475 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 80 Schenectady 633 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 82 Sullivan 250 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 83 Ulster 3178 83.22 Mt. Marion, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 84 Warren 12800 85.68 Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
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Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 85 Washington 600 80.44 Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 87 Westchester 295 NO BID
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 63 Fulton 1000 68.7900$   Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 159 Tompkins 1200 51.95 Lansing, NY ClearLane® Green

Morton Salt, Inc. 52 Albany 8,000 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 53 Bronx 44 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 54 Broome 400 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 55 Cayuga 4,706 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 56 Chautauqua 1,035 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 57 Chenango 200 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 58 Columbia 600 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 59 Cortland 1,800 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 60 Erie 240 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 61 Essex 31,600 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 62 Franklin 5,500 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 63 Fulton 1,000 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 64 Greene 6,665 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 65 Herkimer 5,267 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 66 Jefferson 6,000 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 67 Lewis 700 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 68 Livingston 700 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 69 Madison 1815 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 70 Monroe 2800 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 71 Montgomery 551 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 72 Nassau 1000 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 73 Oneida 10855 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 74 Onondaga 12963 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 75 Ontario 250 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 76 Orange 2335 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 77 Otsego 100 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 78 Rensselaer 910 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 79 Rockland 2475 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 80 Schenectady 633 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 81 Suffolk 55 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 82 Sullivan 250 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 83 Ulster 3178 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 84 Warren 12800 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 85 Washington 600 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 86 Wayne 200 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 87 Westchester 295 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 159 Tompkins 1200 No Bid

North American Salt Co. 52 Albany 8,000 No BID
North American Salt Co. 53 Bronx 44 No BID
North American Salt Co. 54 Broome 400 No BID
North American Salt Co. 55 Cayuga 4,706 No BID
North American Salt Co. 56 Chautauqua 1,035 No BID
North American Salt Co. 57 Chenango 200 No BID
North American Salt Co. 58 Columbia 600 No BID
North American Salt Co. 59 Cortland 1,800 No BID
North American Salt Co. 60 Erie 240 No BID
North American Salt Co. 61 Essex 31,600 No BID
North American Salt Co. 62 Franklin 5,500 No BID
North American Salt Co. 63 Fulton 1,000 No BID
North American Salt Co. 64 Greene 6,665 No BID
North American Salt Co. 65 Herkimer 5,267 No BID
North American Salt Co. 66 Jefferson 6,000 No BID
North American Salt Co. 67 Lewis 700 No BID
North American Salt Co. 68 Livingston 700 No BID
North American Salt Co. 69 Madison 1815 No BID
North American Salt Co. 70 Monroe 2800 No BID
North American Salt Co. 71 Montgomery 551 No BID
North American Salt Co. 72 Nassau 1000 No BID
North American Salt Co. 73 Oneida 10855 No BID
North American Salt Co. 74 Onondaga 12963 No BID
North American Salt Co. 75 Ontario 250 No BID
North American Salt Co. 76 Orange 2335 No BID
North American Salt Co. 77 Otsego 100 No BID
North American Salt Co. 78 Rensselaer 910 No BID
North American Salt Co. 79 Rockland 2475 No BID
North American Salt Co. 80 Schenectady 633 No BID
North American Salt Co. 81 Suffolk 55 No BID
North American Salt Co. 82 Sullivan 250 No BID
North American Salt Co. 83 Ulster 3178 No BID
North American Salt Co. 84 Warren 12800 No BID
North American Salt Co. 85 Washington 600 No BID
North American Salt Co. 86 Wayne 200 No BID
North American Salt Co. 87 Westchester 295 No BID



LOT III  - Treated Salt, Type II

Bidder
Item 

Number County
Filed Requirement 

(tons)  Price per Ton  Stockpile Locations  Finished Product Name  Salt Color 
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 88 Albany 500 82.8800$       Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 89 Chautauqua 3878 69.7400$       Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 90 Clinton 3500 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 92 Dutchess 4300 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 93 Erie 6115 63.7000$       Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 94 Genesee 3375 57.9000$       Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 95 Monroe 6860 59.0500$       Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 97 Ontario 8048 61.1500$       Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 98 Orleans 300 60.9000$       Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 99 Otsego 350 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 101 St Lawrence 1250 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 102 Seneca 1925 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 103 Steuben 70 62.0100$       Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 105 Tompkins 3,200 No Bid
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 106 Warren 400 91.6900$       Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 107 Wayne 600 62.9500$       Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 96 Niagara 7,000 66.87$           Hampton Corners, NY Fire Rock Blue

Atlantic Salt, Inc. 88 Albany 500 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 89 Chautauqua 3878 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 90 Clinton 3500 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 92 Dutchess 4,300 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 93 Erie 6,115 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 94 Genesee 3375 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 95 Monroe 6860 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 97 Ontario 8048 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 98 Orleans 300 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 99 Otsego 350 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 101 St Lawrence 1250 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 102 Seneca 1925 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 103 Steuben 70 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 105 Tompkins 3200 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 106 Warren 400 No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 107 Wayne 600 No Bid

Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 88 Albany 500  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 89 Chautauqua 3878  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 90 Clinton 3500  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 92 Dutchess 4300  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 93 Erie 6115  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 94 Genesee 3375  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 95 Monroe 6860  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 97 Ontario 8,048  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 98 Orleans 300  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 99 Otsego 350  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 101 St Lawrence 1250  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 102 Seneca 1,925  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 103 Steuben 70  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 105 Tompkins 3200  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 106 Warren 400  NO BID 
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 107 Wayne 600  NO BID 

Morton Salt, Inc. 88 Albany 500 79.4300$       Albany, NY Brownish/Green
Morton Salt, Inc. 89 Chautauqua 3878 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 90 Clinton 3500 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 92 Dutchess 4300 81.7700$       Albany, NY Brownish/Green
Morton Salt, Inc. 93 Erie 6115 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 94 Genesee 3375 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 95 Monroe 6860 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 97 Ontario 8048 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 98 Orleans 300 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 99 Otsego 350 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 101 St Lawrence 1250 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 102 Seneca 1925 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 103 Steuben 70 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 105 Tompkins 3200 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 106 Warren 400 87.9800$       Albany, NY Brownish/Green
Morton Salt, Inc. 107 Wayne 600 No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 91 Columbia 90 74.7500$       Albany, NY Brownish/Green
Morton Salt, Inc. 100 Putnam 600 94.5100$       Albany, NY Brownish/Green
Morton Salt, Inc. 104 Suffolk 10000 124.1700$     Port Newark, NJ Brownish/Green

North American Salt Co. 90 Clinton 3,500 117.96$         Johnstown, ON THAWROX BLUE
North American Salt Co. 101 St Lawrence 1250 117.9600$     Johnstown, ON THAWROX BLUE
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LOT IV  - Emergency Road Salt

Bidder
Item 
Number County  Price per Ton  Stockpile Locations 

 Rock or 
Solar 

American Rock Salt Co., LLC 108 Albany 88.1168 Troy, NY Rock  
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 109 Allegany 77.4136 Hampton Corners Rock  
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 111 Broome 89.556 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 112 Cattaraugus 83.8764 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 113 Cayuga & Seneca 83.3288 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 114 Chautauqua 88.2568 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 115 Chemung & Tioga 77.0576 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 116 Chenango 94.1592 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 117 Clinton 149.1136 Norwood, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 118 Columbia 93.0784 Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 119 Cortland & Tompkins 110.3504 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 120 Delaware 90.0832 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 121 Dutchess* 133.3552 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 122 Erie 78.90$               Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 123 Essex 108.0664 Norwood, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 124 Franklin 149.1084 Ogdensburg, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 125 Fulton & Montgomery 121.7744 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 126 Genesee & Orleans 77.1352$           Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 127 Greene 122.8568 Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 128 Hamilton 129.2448 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 129 Herkimer 116.376 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 130 Jefferson 86.7768 Watertown, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 131 Lewis 89.6536 Weedsport, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 132 Livingston & Wyoming 74.91$               Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 133 Madison 89.7464 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 134 Monroe 76.3064 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 135 Nassau* 132.6384 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 136 Niagara 79.9 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 137 Oneida 92.0984 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 138 Onondaga 84.684 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 139 Ontario 77.1352 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 140 Orange* 130.0736 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 141 Oswego 78.6144 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 142 Otsego 119.4784 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 143 Putnam* 137.3088 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 144 Rensselaer 87.68 Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 145 Rockland* 136.144 Hampton Corners
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 146 St. Lawrence 122.48 Norwood, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 147 Saratoga 89.1508$           Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 148 Schenectady 87.47$               Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 149 Schoharie 124.4848 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 150 Schuyler & Yates 80.22$               Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 151 Steuben 78.468 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 152 Suffolk* 137.0288 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 153 Sullivan 123.9808 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 154 Ulster 129.6816 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 155 Warren 98.146 Fort Ann, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 156 Washington 91.6876 Troy, NY Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 157 Wayne 75.6888 Hampton Corners Rock
American Rock Salt Co., LLC 158 Westchester* 141.0944 Hampton Corners Rock

Atlantic Salt, Inc. 108 Albany No Bid Rock  
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 109 Allegany No Bid Rock  
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 110 Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens, Richmond* No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 111 Broome No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 112 Cattaraugus No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 113 Cayuga & Seneca No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 114 Chautauqua No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 115 Chemung & Tioga No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 116 Chenango No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 117 Clinton No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 118 Columbia No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 119 Cortland & Tompkins No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 120 Delaware No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 121 Dutchess* No Bid
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 122 Erie No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 123 Essex No Bid Rock
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Atlantic Salt, Inc. 124 Franklin No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 125 Fulton & Montgomery No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 126 Genesee & Orleans No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 127 Greene No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 128 Hamilton No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 129 Herkimer No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 130 Jefferson No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 131 Lewis No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 132 Livingston & Wyoming No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 133 Madison No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 134 Monroe No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 135 Nassau* 129.7      84 Marsh St, Newark, NJ ock and Solar
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 136 Niagara No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 137 Oneida No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 138 Onondaga No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 139 Ontario No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 140 Orange* 145.75$                   84 Marsh St, Newark, NJ ck and Solar
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 141 Oswego No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 142 Otsego No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 143 Putnam* 143.65      84 Marsh St, Newark, NJ ock and Solar
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 144 Rensselaer No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 145 Rockland* 129      84 Marsh St, Newark, NJ ock and Solar
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 146 St. Lawrence No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 147 Saratoga No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 148 Schenectady No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 149 Schoharie No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 150 Schuyler & Yates No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 151 Steuben No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 152 Suffolk* 133.6      84 Marsh St, Newark, NJ ock and Solar
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 153 Sullivan No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 154 Ulster No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 155 Warren No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 156 Washington No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 157 Wayne No Bid Rock
Atlantic Salt, Inc. 158 Westchester* 128.69      84 Marsh St, Newark, NJ ock and Solar

Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 108 Albany 99 Albany, NY Rock  
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 109 Allegany 109 Lansing, NY Rock  
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 110 Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens, Richmond* 135 Port Newark, NJ Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 111 Broome 99 Conklin, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 112 Cattaraugus 109 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 113 Cayuga & Seneca 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 114 Chautauqua 118 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 115 Chemung & Tioga 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 116 Chenango 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 117 Clinton 118 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 118 Columbia 99 Fort Plain, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 119 Cortland & Tompkins 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 120 Delaware 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 121 Dutchess* 105 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 122 Erie 105 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 123 Essex 105 Albany, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 124 Franklin 118 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 125 Fulton & Montgomery 99 Fort Plain, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 126 Genesee & Orleans 105.00$             Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 127 Greene 99.00$               Albany, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 128 Hamilton 99 Fort Plain, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 129 Herkimer 99.00$               Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 130 Jefferson 99.0000$           Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 131 Lewis 99.00$               Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 132 Livingston & Wyoming 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 133 Madison 99.00$               Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 134 Monroe 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 135 Nassau* 135.00$             Port Newark, NJ Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 136 Niagara 105.00$             Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 137 Oneida 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 138 Onondaga 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 139 Ontario 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 140 Orange* 99 Bloomingburg, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 141 Oswego 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 142 Otsego 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 143 Putnam* 99.00$               Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 144 Rensselaer 99 Albany, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 145 Rockland* 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 146 St. Lawrence 118 Lansing, NY Rock



Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 147 Saratoga 99 Albany, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 148 Schenectady 99 Albany, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 149 Schoharie 99 Albany, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 150 Schuyler & Yates 99 Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 151 Steuben 109.0000$         Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 152 Suffolk* 135.00$             Port Newark, NJ Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 153 Sullivan 99.00$               Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 154 Ulster 99 Mount Marion, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 155 Warren 99 Albany, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 156 Washington 99 Albany, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 157 Wayne 99.00$               Lansing, NY Rock
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit 158 Westchester* 122 Port Newark, NJ Rock

Morton Salt, Inc. 108 Albany 101.4300$         Albany, NY Rock  
Morton Salt, Inc. 109 Allegany No Bid Rock  
Morton Salt, Inc. 110 Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens, Richmond* No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 111 Broome No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 112 Cattaraugus No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 113 Cayuga & Seneca No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 114 Chautauqua No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 115 Chemung & Tioga No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 116 Chenango No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 117 Clinton No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 118 Columbia 96.75 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 119 Cortland & Tompkins No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 120 Delaware No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 121 Dutchess* 103.77 Albany, NY
Morton Salt, Inc. 122 Erie No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 123 Essex No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 124 Franklin No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 125 Fulton & Montgomery 105.27 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 126 Genesee & Orleans No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 127 Greene 102.58 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 128 Hamilton No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 129 Herkimer No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 130 Jefferson No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 131 Lewis No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 132 Livingston & Wyoming No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 133 Madison No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 134 Monroe No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 135 Nassau* 143.29 Port Newark, NJ
Morton Salt, Inc. 136 Niagara No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 137 Oneida No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 138 Onondaga No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 139 Ontario No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 140 Orange* No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 141 Oswego No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 142 Otsego No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 143 Putnam* 116.51 Albany, NY
Morton Salt, Inc. 144 Rensselaer 101.45 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 145 Rockland* 125.09 Port Newark, NJ
Morton Salt, Inc. 146 St. Lawrence No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 147 Saratoga 98.57$               Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 148 Schenectady 100.99 Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 149 Schoharie No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 150 Schuyler & Yates No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 151 Steuben No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 152 Suffolk* 146.17 Port Newark, NJ
Morton Salt, Inc. 153 Sullivan No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 154 Ulster 108.73$             Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 155 Warren 109.9800$         Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 156 Washington 107.25$             Albany, NY Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 157 Wayne No Bid Rock
Morton Salt, Inc. 158 Westchester* 129.13$             Port Newark, NJ

North American Salt Co. 108 Albany NO BID Rock  
North American Salt Co. 109 Allegany NO BID Rock  

North American Salt Co. 110 Bronx, Kings, New York, Queens, Richmond* NO BID
North American Salt Co. 111 Broome NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 112 Cattaraugus NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 113 Cayuga & Seneca NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 114 Chautauqua NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 115 Chemung & Tioga NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 116 Chenango NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 117 Clinton NO BID Rock



North American Salt Co. 118 Columbia NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 119 Cortland & Tompkins NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 120 Delaware NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 121 Dutchess* NO BID
North American Salt Co. 122 Erie NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 123 Essex NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 124 Franklin NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 125 Fulton & Montgomery NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 126 Genesee & Orleans NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 127 Greene NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 128 Hamilton NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 129 Herkimer NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 130 Jefferson NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 131 Lewis NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 132 Livingston & Wyoming NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 133 Madison NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 134 Monroe NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 135 Nassau* NO BID
North American Salt Co. 136 Niagara NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 137 Oneida NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 138 Onondaga NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 139 Ontario NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 140 Orange* NO BID
North American Salt Co. 141 Oswego NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 142 Otsego NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 143 Putnam* NO BID
North American Salt Co. 144 Rensselaer NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 145 Rockland* NO BID
North American Salt Co. 146 St. Lawrence NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 147 Saratoga NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 148 Schenectady NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 149 Schoharie NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 150 Schuyler & Yates NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 151 Steuben NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 152 Suffolk* NO BID
North American Salt Co. 153 Sullivan NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 154 Ulster NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 155 Warren NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 156 Washington NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 157 Wayne NO BID Rock
North American Salt Co. 158 Westchester* NO BID
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